
FORTIGATE FIREWALL UPGRADE
TITLE: E-2022-1363BD
DATE:

ITEM # ITEM DESCRIPTION UOM QTY UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL
UNIT 
PRICE

TOTAL

1 FortiGate-1800F EA 4 $30,617.20 $122,468.80 46,186.00$  $184,744.00 54,427.85$  $217,711.40 30,021.00$  $120,084.00 37,362.02$  $149,448.08 36,209.97$  $144,839.88 45,724.14$  $182,896.56 34,757.27$    $139,029.08 No Bid No Bid

2
FortiGate-1800 F, 1-Year 
Enterprise Protection EA 4 $30,061.44 $120,245.76 $39,258.10 $157,032.40

Included in 
line item# 1

Included in 
line item# 1 $25,517.00 $102,068.00 $31,763.72 $127,054.88 $32,830.37 $131,321.48 $36,117.45 $144,469.80 $31,513.26 $126,053.04 No Bid No Bid

3

Fortinet Professional Service 
Resource Service (SOW) 
Consultant EA 3 $2,922.47 $8,767.41 $3,000.00 $9,000.00 $2,784.40 $8,353.20 $2,790.00 $8,370.00 $2,878.79 $8,636.37 $2,979.21 $8,937.63 $3,100.00 $9,300.00 $2,859.69 $8,579.07 No Bid No Bid

4
Fortinet FortiGate Rack Slide 
Rail Kit EA 4 $163.00 $652.00 $213.00 $852.00 $158.29 $633.16 $138.00 $552.00 $172.12 $688.48 $166.99 $667.96 $208.21 $832.84 $160.29 $641.16 No Bid No Bid

$252,133.97 $351,628.40 $226,697.76 $231,074.00 $285,827.81 $285,766.95 $337,499.20 $274,302.35 $0.00

5

Year 2 Renewal: FortiGate-
1800F 1-Year Enterprise 
Protection EA 4 No bid No bid No bid No bid 20,114.60$  80,458.40$   33,369.00$  133,476.00$  31,763.72$  127,054.88$  32,830.37$  131,321.48$  36,117.45$  144,469.80$  No bid $0.00 No Bid No Bid

6

Year 3 Renewal: FortiGate-
1800F 1-Year Enterprise 
Protection EA 4 No bid No bid No bid No bid 20,114.60$  80,458.40$   33,369.00$  133,476.00$  31,763.72$  127,054.88$  32,830.37$  131,321.48$  36,117.45$  144,469.80$  94,539.79$    378,159.16$    No Bid No Bid

7

Year 4 Renewal: FortiGate-
1800F 1-Year Enterprise 
Protection EA 4 No bid No bid No bid No bid 20,114.60$  80,458.40$   33,369.00$  133,476.00$  31,763.72$  127,054.88$  32,830.37$  131,321.48$  36,117.45$  144,469.80$  No bid $0.00 No Bid No Bid

8

Year 5 Renewal: FortiGate-
1800F 1-Year Enterprise 
Protection EA 4 No bid No bid No bid No bid 20,114.60$  80,458.40$   33,369.00$  133,476.00$  31,763.72$  127,054.88$  32,830.37$  131,321.48$  36,117.45$  144,469.80$  157,566.31$  630,265.24$    No Bid No Bid

$0.00 $0.00 $321,833.60 $533,904.00 $508,219.52 $525,285.92 $577,879.20 $1,008,424.40 $0.00 (Not A Basis for Award) SUBTOTAL:

LOWEST BIDDER

Charity IT
(non-responsive)

vCloud Tech, Inc
(non-responsive)
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NH&A, LLC
Granite 

Telecommunications
Hypertec USA, Inc.

10/13/2022


	Sheet1

